
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

WATER LEADERS OF 67 COUNTRIES SHARE THEIR EXPERIENCE 
 
Water ministers and other national water policy leaders from all regions of the world have seized the 
opportunity to contribute to a landmark global report on water policy, set to be released this year.  

The inaugural Water Policy Report will reveal the key social, political, financial and structural barriers 
inhibiting better progress on water issues, as identified through the 2021 Water Leaders Survey.  

Those invited to complete the current Water Leaders Survey include water ministers and heads of 
national water departments and agencies as well as other persons with national water leadership roles.   

Tom Soo, Chair of the Water Policy Group project team, said that the response from national water 
leaders has been very positive. 
 
“Water leaders worldwide have embraced the opportunity to contribute anonymously to the Survey and 
to share their personal experience,” said Mr Soo.  
 
“Officials responsible for guiding national water management will be able to use the Water Policy Report 
to determine which of their particular challenges are shared by other countries and, therefore, provide an 
opportunity to learn from their experiences.”   
 
The survey asks for the opinions and perspectives of national water leaders on many topics within their 
responsibilities, including risks to maintaining or achieving good water management in their country, how 
COVID-19 has affected national water outcomes and the relative importance in their country of the five 
accelerators in the United Nations SDG6 Global Acceleration Framework. The survey also contains 
questions specific to groundwater challenges, aligning with the theme of the next United Nations World 
Water Development Report. 
 
“The Water Policy Report will be based on the aggregated responses of national water leaders in each 
UN geographic region and show challenges and constraints at both the global and regional levels. As 
such, the Report will provide new and genuine insight about the issues governments are facing in their 
pursuit to achieve Sustainable Development Goal 6”, Mr Soo said. 
 
The project is being led by the Water Policy Group with support from the University of New South Wales 
Global Water Institute. The Survey will close in August 2021. National water leaders from all countries 
are invited to participate. Questions about eligibility and survey access can be directed to 
survey@waterpolicygroup.com. 
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Water Policy Group (www.waterpolicygroup.com) is a global network of water sector experts who have 
been decision makers and trusted advisers within governments and international bodies handling water 
policy and strategy. The members of the group have had direct experience in working with complex water 
policy issues, and share a common goal that their knowledge, networks and experience can help achieve 
the sustainable development of water resource to serve the global public interest. 
The UNSW Global Water Institute (www.globalwaterinstitute.unsw.edu.au) brings together water 
research expertise from the faculties of Law, Science, Engineering, Public Health, Social Science and 
Business. UNSW is currently ranked 8th in the world for water resources and is globally renowned for its 
water research, consulting, education and technical advice. 

https://www.unwater.org/sdg6-action-space/#:%7E:text=SDG%206%20Global%20Acceleration%20Framework%20%E2%80%93%20Action%20Space&text=The%20SDG%206%20Global%20Acceleration,deliver%20the%20SDGs%20by%202030.
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